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BID SUMMARY

FURNISHING ELECTRICAL MATERIALS
CITY OF MADISON
MADISON, SOUTH DAKOTA
CITY BID NUMBER 890

Bid Letting: March 5, 2020

1302 South Union Street 2:00 p.m.
Rock Rapids, IA 51246 City Office
DGR Project No. 415928 Page 1 of 1
Bid No. 1 Bid No. 1 Bid No. 2 Bid No. 3 Bid No. 4 Bid No. 5 Bid No. 6
Padmount Switchgear Padmount Switchgear Single Phase Transformers Three Phase Transformers 15 kV Primary Power Cable 600V Secondary Power Cable Streetlight Poles
Total Bid Total Bid
Bid (Option 1) (Option 2)
Bidder and Address Security Live Front Manuf/Delivery Dead Front Manuf/Delivery Total Base Bid | Evaluation Bid Manuf/Delivery Total Base Bid | Evaluation Bid Manuf/Delivery Total Bid Manuf/Delivery Total Bid Manuf/Delivery Total Bid Manuf/Delivery
Federal Pacific
RESCO Federal Pacific 8-10 wks ARO Ermco
4100 30th Ave S. 10% $56,029.90 | 8-10 wks ARO $64,978.60 Nordic $86,339.35 $170,891.35 8-10 wks ARO $76,865.00 | $223,250.20 Ermco $90,090.00 Kerite INCOMPLETE BID $42,555.00 Valmont
Moorhead , MN 56561-0160 Bid Bond Nordic 22-24 wks ARO Nordic 12-14 wks ARO 6-8 wks ARO 7-9 wks
22-24 wks ARO | $ 65,661.20 | Alternate-Concast some mid-late April
8-10 wks ARO rest mid-late June
Howard-Amorphous Howard-Amorphous
Irby Utilities S&C S&C $104,275.00 $172,166.20 7/7/2020 $104,983.00 | $228,930.20 7/7/2020
1575 B Samco Road 10% $53,020.00 6/15/2020 $70,600.00 6/15/2020 Highline - 5/7/2020 $95,095.00 Kerite $35,850.00 Southwire NO BID
Rapid City, SD 57702 Bid Bond Highline Highline Howard-Silicon Howard-Silicon 6-8 wks ARO 5/15/2020
5/15/2020 5/15/2020 $85,218.00 $176,956.40 7/7/2020 $103,489.00 | $253,373.80 7/7/2020
Highline - 5/7/2020
WESCO
9 Okonite Valmont
2501 East 3rd St 10% NO BID NO BID NO BID $83,352.50 $34,775.00 CME $40,320.00
Sioux City, IA 51101 Bid Bond (1) stock 4/0 2wks 9 wks
subject to 350 3-4 wks
prior sale
Border States Electric Cooper
1401 N Minnesota Ave 10% NO BID $88,370.00 | $180,202.00 8-12 wks ARO $103,339.65 | $250,343.65 Cooper NO BID $36,200.00 Southwire $42,339.00 Valmont
Sioux Falls, SD 57104 Bid Bond Hubbell 23-26 wks 2-4 wks 7-9 wks
stock
Dakota Supply Group Federal Pacific Federal Pacific
) - _ Valmont
3610 N. St. Paul 10% $57,453.40 | 8-10 wks ARO $65,679.60 8-10 wks ARO NO BID $86,670.00 | $253,626.40 WEG NO BID NO BID $44,880.00
Sioux Falls, SD 57104 Bid Bond Nordic Nordic 32-34 wks 7-9 wks
22-24 wks ARO 22-24 wks ARO
Graybar
9 General Cable P&K
2810 North 1st Ave 10% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,155.00 $31,680.00
Sioux Falls, SD 57104 Bid Bond 4-6 wks 14 wks
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CORRECTED AMOUNT SHOWN SHADED

(1) Cu.$2.61/Ibs, AL $.90/Ibs




